
We bring accelerators, agility, and a vision to re-
ignite your digital commerce addressing 
immediate needs while making it flexible and 
continuous to address your different business 
needs and goals. 

Start your SAP Commerce journey with award 
winning global leader in commerce and SAP’s 
number one global partner.

Elevate your brand with Accenture Interactive.  

Engage with Accenture to transform your 
customers’ experience and accelerate growth 
like never before.

Reimagine Commerce with Accenture. To learn 
more, visit our website.

The new normal has propelled eCommerce into 
the spotlight. It has accelerated growth in digital 
commerce across all sectors and industries, 
from beauty to packaged goods to industrial 
equipment. 

However, with the shift from traditional route to 
digital channels of engagement in commerce, 
there emerges a need for delivering a 
differentiated customer experience that elevates 
your brand.  

We are offering a special design, accelerators 
and implementation solution for businesses to 
go live quickly and cost effectively on SAP 
Commerce Cloud. 

Combining the best of Accenture Interactive and 
SAP Commerce Cloud, our Lean Commerce 
solution, helps businesses quickly customize 
and unlock the value of Commerce Cloud

A flexible, cost-effective and agile solution, Lean 
Commerce can help businesses jump start their 
commerce journey and become live in as quick 
as 4 weeks.

Lean Commerce offers 3 implementation tiers: 
emerald, ruby, and sapphire, in addition to the 
upgrade and migration package to the latest 
SAP cloud. 
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